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ABSTRACT

Lumbar disc herniation (LDH) is a frequent cause of low back pain and radiculopathy, disability, and diminution in

quality of life. While nonsurgical care remains the mainstay of initial treatment, symptoms that persist for prolonged
periods of time are well treated with discectomy surgery. A large body of evidence shows that, in patients with
unremitting symptoms despite a reasonable period of nonsurgical treatment, discectomy surgery is safe and efficacious.

In patients with symptoms lasting greater than 6 weeks, various forms of discectomy (open, microtubular, and
endoscopic) are superior to continued nonsurgical treatment. The small but significant proportion of patients with
recurrent disc herniation experience less improvement overall than patients who do not experience reherniation after

primary discectomy. Lumbar discectomy patients with large annular defects (�6 mm wide) are at a higher risk for
recurrent herniation and revision surgery. Annular closure via a bone-anchored device has been shown to decrease the
rate of recurrent disc herniation and associated reoperation in these high-risk patients. After a detailed review of the
literature, current clinical evidence supports discectomy (open, microtubular, or endoscopic discectomy) as a medically

necessary procedure for the treatment of LDH with radiculopathy in indicated patients. Furthermore, there is new
scientific evidence that supports the use of bone-anchored annular closure in patients with large annular defects, who are
at greater risk for recurrent disc herniation.

Testing & Regulatory Affairs

Keywords: lumbar disc herniation, radiculopathy, discectomy, annular closure

INTRODUCTION

Lumbar disc herniation (LDH) is a localized
displacement of intervertebral disc material beyond
the normal perimeter of the disc space.1,2 Depending
on the volume, location, and type of herniation,
adjacent neural structures may become compressed,
resulting in radiculopathy associated with pain,
numbness, or weakness.3,4 Impingement of the
lumbosacral nerves by a herniated disc is the leading
cause of sciatica, which is characterized by low back
pain and radiating leg pain.5

Patient history and physical examination are the
most important steps in the diagnosis of LDH with
radiculopathy.1 The physical examination may
include manual muscle testing, sensory testing,
supine straight leg raise, Lasegue’s sign, and crossed
Lasegue’s sign.1 Other functional tests (eg, Bell test,
hyperextension test, reflex tests, nerve stretch test,
lumbar range of motion test) have varying degrees

of sensitivity and specificity, but can be incorporat-

ed depending on a physician’s experience and

preference.1,6 If the patient history and physical

examination results are consistent with symptomatic

LDH, noninvasive visualization of the neural

structures is used to confirm disc herniation.

Magnetic resonance imaging (MRI) is considered

the most appropriate modality to confirm LDH, but

computed tomography (CT) with or without mye-

lography should be considered if MRI is contrain-

dicated or inconclusive.7,8

Many patients with symptomatic LDH, particu-

larly those with mild or moderate symptoms, will

improve with nonsurgical management, which may

include manual spinal manipulation, physical ther-

apy, nonsteroidal anti-inflammatory drugs, analge-

sics, and/or corticosteroid injections.1,9,10 Results

from randomized controlled trials (RCTs) have

shown that 35% to 54% of patients assigned to
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continued nonsurgical care undergo discectomy
within 6 months due to persistent or aggravating
symptoms.11–14 A survey of 814 neurosurgeons
found that 46% of respondents recommended a
minimum of 4 to 8 weeks of nonsurgical manage-
ment before surgery is indicated, 34% recommend-
ed 8 weeks or more, and 20% recommended less
than 4 weeks.15 Based on a health technology
assessment, which included a systematic literature
review, public feedback, and voting from a clinical
committee, the Washington State Health Care
Authority requires at least 6 weeks of nonsurgical
care unless progressive motor weakness is pre-
sent.16,17 Thus, the decision to continue nonsurgical
care or undergo surgery considers the patient
history, physical examination, radiological findings,
and severity of symptoms.

When surgery is indicated, discectomy is the
primary surgical intervention for LDH with radic-
ulopathy.18 The principal goals of discectomy are to
surgically remove the displaced disc material,
decompress the affected neural structures to relieve
symptoms, and minimize the chance of recurrence
by removing loose or degenerated material from the
intervertebral space and surrounding area. Discec-
tomy can be performed through an open, mini-open
(eg, microtubular), or endoscopic approach. Each of
these methods enables direct, light-based visualiza-
tion, in contrast to percutaneous techniques that
solely use intra-operative radiological imaging for
indirect visualization.

Upon completion of the discectomy, prior to
closure, there are currently no widely accepted
practices for repair of the annulus fibrosus. Studies
have shown that large (�6 mm wide), unrepaired
annular defects increase the risk of symptom
recurrence and additional surgery.19,20 These data
have led to the development of several annular
closure or repair devices to help reduce the risk of
recurrence and reoperation in this high-risk patient
population. Most of those techniques and closure
systems lacked clinical evidence and are no longer
commercially available. A bone-anchored implant is
Food and Drug Administration (FDA) approved
and has clinical evidence demonstrating effective-
ness for large annular defects.

The aim of this International Society for the
Advancement of Spine Surgery (ISASS) Policy
Statement is to discuss the evidence from RCTs,
prospective cohort studies, and recent meta-analyses
to inform treatment and coverage recommendations

for primary discectomy and annular repair in
indicated patients with LDH and radiculopathy.

SUMMARY OF THE CLINICAL
EVIDENCE

Discectomy Versus Nonsurgical Care for LDH With
Radiculopathy

Several RCTs and prospective cohort studies
have shown that discectomy provides faster and/or
greater pain relief, recovery from disability, and
patient satisfaction compared to continued nonsur-
gical care (Table 1).11–14,21,22 Clinical evidence also
indicates that discectomy-related surgical complica-
tions are rare. The most common complications
include dural tears (1%–4% of cases),11,13,14,21,23

blood transfusions (2%–3% of cases),14,21,23 and
neural injuries (0.4% of cases).21 None of the RCTs
or prospective cohort studies reported cases of
perioperative mortality,11–14,17,21–25 indicating that
the risk of discectomy-related death is negligible. A
recent (2019) analysis of 34 639 LDH operations
performed over 15 years found that complications
occurred in only 2.7% (95% confidence interval:
2.6%–2.9%) of cases, with no perioperative
deaths.18

Early evidence on the efficacy of discectomy for
symptomatic LDH came from a large, multicenter
prospective cohort study called the Maine Lumbar
Spine Study (MLSS).21 The MLSS involved 275
patients treated surgically and 232 treated with
nonsurgical care. At the 1-year follow-up, patients
treated with discectomy reported greater improve-
ment in back and leg pain (P , .001), functional
status (P , .001), and overall satisfaction
(P ¼ .005) compared to nonsurgical care.21 Addi-
tionally, a larger percentage of patients in the
discectomy group reported complete relief from
their predominant symptoms (31% versus 11%;
P , .001). Long-term follow-up analyses in the
MLSS reported that these greater improvements
among discectomy-treated patients persisted over 5
years for leg pain, back pain, function, and
satisfaction (P � .001) and over 8 to 10 years for
leg pain and function (P , .05).26,27

The Spine Patient Outcomes Research Trial
(SPORT) is a large, National Institutes of Health-
funded, multicenter RCT and an observational
cohort study comparing discectomy versus nonsur-
gical care in patients with lumbar radiculopathy
secondary to LDH. The RCT included 501 patients
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with confirmed symptomatic LDH treated with
discectomy (n ¼ 245) or nonsurgical care
(n¼ 256).14 Patients eligible for surgery had radic-
ular pain, a positive straight leg test, or neurologic
deficit, failed at least 6 weeks of nonsurgical care,
and had radiologically confirmed LDH. In the RCT
arm of the study, 45% of patients randomized to
nonsurgical care crossed over to surgery, and 40%
of patients randomized to surgery chose to continue
with nonsurgical care. Furthermore, patients that
crossed over to surgery had significantly worse
baseline scores for Short Form 36 (SF-36) bodily
pain (P¼ .03) and function (P , .001), Oswestry
Disability Index (ODI; P , .001), sciatica frequen-
cy (P ¼ .009), and sciatica bothersomeness
(P ¼ .001). These confounding events likely explain
why the intent-to-treat (ITT) analysis did not detect
significant differences in pain, function, or disability
between treatment groups. ITT analysis is intended
to reduce the risk of bias by evaluating results
according to the randomized treatment allocation,
irrespective of the treatment that patients actually
received.28 In RCTs with high crossover or non-
adherence rates, ITT analyses are difficult to
interpret, and an as-treated analysis is recommend-
ed to determine the treatment effect.29 In the
SPORT RCT, an as-treated analysis evaluated
outcomes based on the adjusted covariates of time
and treatments actually received.14 Those results
showed significantly better improvements in the SF-
36 pain and function scores, ODI, sciatica scores, as
well as higher patient satisfaction, at all timepoints
in the discectomy group compared to nonsurgical
care.14

In addition to randomized patients, SPORT also
included observational cohorts comprised of pa-
tients that declined to be in the RCT.23 In the
observational cohorts, 528 patients were treated
with discectomy, and 191 patients received nonsur-
gical care over the first 2 years. Compared to the
nonsurgical group, patients in the discectomy group
had significantly greater improvements in primary
outcomes (ie, bodily pain, physical function, and
ODI) and secondary outcomes (ie, sciatica bother-
someness, satisfaction, and self-rated improvement)
over 2 years of follow up (P , .001 for all
metrics).23 An as-treated subgroup analysis of
combined observational and randomized cohorts
demonstrated that all 37 subgroups experienced
significantly greater improvements with discectomy
compared to nonsurgical care (P , .05).30 Some of

the subgroups with the greatest treatment effect
from discectomy included older patients (age . 41
years), those with deteriorating symptoms at base-
line, and those without joint problems.30 Longer
term follow-up studies of the combined SPORT
cohorts confirmed that the benefits of discectomy
persisted through 8 years.31–33 As-treated analyses
at 8 years follow up adjusted for potential covari-
ates, such as demographics, smoking status, and
LDH location, which demonstrated significant
benefits in favor of discectomy for all primary and
secondary outcomes of pain, function, sciatica
bothersomeness, patient satisfaction, and self-rated
improvement (P , .001 for all metrics).33 Together,
the SPORT study as a whole represents robust and
high-quality clinical evidence in support of discec-
tomy compared with nonsurgical care in both short-
and long-term benefits for treatment of LDH with
radiculopathy among indicated patients.

Three more RCTs and 1 prospective cohort
study demonstrated positive outcomes with discec-
tomy compared to nonsurgical care at early time-
points.11–13,22 Peul et al11 conducted a multicenter
RCT comparing 141 patients treated with discectomy
versus 142 patients treated with continued nonsurgi-
cal care. All patients had radiculopathy and radio-
logically confirmed LDH. Thirty-nine percent of
patients assigned to nonsurgical care crossed over to
discectomy within 1 year, and 11% assigned to
surgery continued with nonsurgical care. Based on
ITT analysis, discectomy resulted in greater symptom
relief at early timepoints of 2 to 12 weeks. By 1 year,
the differences were not statistically significant;
however, this finding, based on ITT analysis, is
confounded by the high crossover rate from nonsur-
gical care to discectomy. The authors did not report
analysis of the as-treated populations.

Butterman conducted a single-site RCT compar-
ing 50 patients treated with discectomy versus 50
patients treated with epidural steroid injections.13

All patients had clinical symptoms of LDH,
radiologically confirmed disc herniation that en-
compassed more than 25% of the spinal canal cross-
sectional area, and failed at least 6 weeks of
nonsurgical care. Twenty-seven (54%) patients
failed epidural steroid injection treatment and
crossed over to discectomy. The results demonstrat-
ed that discectomy significantly improved leg pain,
bodily pain, ODI, and neurological deficit scores 1
to 3 months after surgery (P , .05), suggesting an
early clinical benefit of discectomy. After 3 months,
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outcomes measures were not statistically different
between treatment groups; the only exception was
that leg pain was improved with discectomy at 4 to 6
months (P , .05).

Österman et al12 conducted a small RCT
analyzing 56 patients: 28 treated with discectomy
and 28 with nonsurgical care. Similar to SPORT
and Peul et al, 39% of patients randomized to
nonsurgical care underwent surgery by 1 year. All
patients allocated to the surgery group underwent
discectomy. Results from the ITT analysis showed
that patients treated with discectomy had signifi-
cantly greater patient satisfaction through 2 years of
follow up and an early advantage in the reduction of
leg pain at 6 weeks follow up. Additional trends in
favor of discectomy were noted; however, interpre-
tation is limited by the small sample size and large
number of crossover patients.

Recently, in a prospective cohort study, Gugliot-
ta et al22 reported that patients treated with
discectomy had significantly reduced North Amer-
ican Spine Society (NASS) questionnaire back pain
at 6 weeks compared to nonsurgical treatment,
indicating a faster improvement in pain with
discectomy. No differences were observed at later
timepoints; however, 42% of patients in the surgery
group and 55% in the nonsurgical care group were
lost to follow up, which limits the data quality at
later timepoints.

In contrast, 1 RCT of 40 patients and 1
prospective cohort study of 497 patients concluded
that there were no significant differences in patient
outcomes between discectomy and nonsurgical care
for symptomatic LDH at 1 year.24,25 Interpretation
of the RCT was limited by a small sample size, large
rate of crossover (40%) in the ITT analysis, and a
lack of as-treated analysis.24 In the cohort study,
patients treated with discectomy and nonsurgical
care experienced a similar, nonsignificant (P ¼ .58)
improvement in the primary outcome (ie, NASS
neurogenic symptoms score) after adjusting for
covariates.25 However, the discectomy group
achieved significantly greater improvements in the
pain and disability scores as well as the mental
component summary of the SF-36 (P , .05), even
after adjustment for covariates.25

A 2019 systematic review and meta-analysis
examined 11 studies (3232 patients) comparing
discectomy versus nonsurgical care.34 Discectomy
was found to be more effective than nonsurgical
care in significantly reducing leg pain (P , .001)

and back pain (P ¼ .02). The authors also reported
a trend towards greater reductions in disability after
discectomy, but the comparison was not statistically
significant (P ¼ .09). Comparison of any surgical
intervention with nonsurgical care can be challeng-
ing and such studies require careful interpretation
(eg, ITT versus as-treated analyses with adjustment
for covariates). While studies of discectomy versus
nonsurgical care can be confounded by high
crossover rates and expectation bias,35 the as-
treated analyses consistently observed a significant
benefit of surgery among indicated patients.

Comparisons of discectomy with an active
control may help limit expectation bias and
crossover rates. Accordingly, a Cochrane Systemat-
ic Review of RCTs on surgical interventions for
LDH also compared discectomy with chemonucle-
olysis.36 Meta-analyses in the Cochrane Review
demonstrated strong evidence for superiority of
chemonucleolysis over placebo as well as strong
evidence for the superiority of discectomy over
chemonucleolysis, which also suggests that discec-
tomy is more effective than placebo.36

Endoscopic Versus Open Discectomy

Endoscopic discectomy is a minimally invasive
technique designed to reduce tissue trauma com-
pared to open discectomy.37,38 As with an open
procedure, an endoscopic approach allows for full
access to the herniated disc under direct visualiza-
tion using an endoscope. Advantages of endoscopic
compared to open discectomy include reduced
incision size and soft tissue damage, which may be
associated with faster recovery.39 The transforami-
nal endoscopic approach obviates the need for
removal of laminar bone and ligamentum flavum,
resulting in less alteration of the anatomy. Disad-
vantages include an unfamiliar approach to most
surgeons and a learning curve, making this ap-
proach technically challenging for many surgeons.40

Clinical studies and meta-analyses have shown
that patients treated with endoscopic discectomy
experience similar improvements in function and
symptom relief when compared to traditional open
discectomy or microdiscectomy.38,41–45 Ruetten et
al38 performed a seminal 200-patient RCT, with
randomization to either conventional microdiscec-
tomy (n ¼ 100) or full-endoscopic discectomy
(transforaminal, n ¼ 41; interlaminar, n ¼ 59).
There were no serious complications in either group,
but the microdiscectomy group had a significantly
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higher rate of nonserious complications, such as
postoperative bleeding or delayed wound healing
(P , .05). Recurrent herniation rates were also
similar between the groups, but the rate of
recurrence was significantly higher among patients
who had a large versus small annular defect,
regardless of treatment type (P , .01). Clinical
outcomes, such as leg pain and disability scores,
were significantly improved in both groups through
2 years follow up (89% follow-up rate), with no
significant differences between groups. However, the
endoscopic group reported significantly less postop-
erative pain, less pain medication use, and fewer
postoperative work disability days (25 days versus
49 days) than the microdiscectomy group (P , .01).

Gibson et al42 performed a prospective RCT
comparing 70 patients treated with transforaminal
endoscopic discectomy (TED) versus 70 patients
treated with microdiscectomy and observed similar
outcomes for improvements in pain and disability
between the 2 groups. However, patients in the TED
group had a shorter mean hospital stay (0.7 versus
1.4 nights; P , .001), suggesting a faster recovery
time. Zhang et al45 reported results from a
systematic review of 9 studies (1527 patients)
comparing microdiscectomy with TED. Results
from the meta-analysis suggested that there were
no significant differences in visual analog scale
(VAS) leg pain, recovery of function following
surgery, operative time, or incidence of complica-
tions. Similar to the study by Gibson et al,
endoscopic discectomy significantly reduced the
length of hospital stay (P , .001).

Prevention of Recurrent LDH

Although primary discectomy is an effective
treatment for LDH with radiculopathy, a small
proportion of patients (5%–15%) experience symp-
tomatic recurrent LDH (rLDH),19,46,47 and 4% to
6% undergo revision surgery within 2 years.48–50

Techniques for management of recurrent herniation
are dependent upon the specific patient indications
and the surgeon’s experience, on a case-by-case
basis. Regardless of the reoperation strategy,
clinical evidence has shown that patients who
undergo revision surgery for symptomatic rLDH
have worse clinical outcomes (eg, pain and disabil-
ity) compared to patients who do not reherniate
following primary discectomy.51–57 Abdu et al52

observed that 9.1% of the 810 SPORT patients
treated with discectomy experienced rLDH and

revision surgery during the 8-year follow-up period.
Compared to patients that did not reherniate, those
with rLDH and revision surgery had significantly
worse SF-36 bodily pain, ODI, and sciatica bother-
someness scores at 4 years follow up (P � .001 for
all metrics). Similarly, a study of patient-reported
outcomes from a large registry (Swespine) demon-
strated that patients who underwent revision
surgery for rLDH experienced significantly less
improvement in VAS leg pain, VAS back pain,
ODI, and EQ-5D health status compared to the
primary LDH group (P � .001 for all metrics).53

Patient factors that may increase the risk of
rLDH include younger age, male gender, work that
requires lifting, worse baseline pain and disability,
lack of motor or sensory deficit, smoking, and
diabetes.46,52,58 An important risk factor for symp-
tomatic rLDH that may be addressable by the
surgeon is a large annular defect (�6 mm wide). A
recent (2018) meta-analysis reported that a large
annular defect increases the odds of a patient
experiencing symptom recurrence or revision sur-
gery by a factor of 2.5 or 2.3, respectively.20 There is
an unmet medical need to address this elevated risk
in patients with large annular defects and avoid the
worse outcomes associated with revision.59 Several
devices have been designed to help repair large
annular defects, including soft tissue suture kits and
bone-anchored annular closure devices (ACDs).
While discectomy is intended to alleviate patient
symptoms by decompressing the impinged neural
structures, annular repair is intended to reduce the
risk of recurrence and revision, thereby sustaining
the clinical benefits of the primary discectomy.

Currently, clinical evidence exists for 2 annular
repair methods: (1) closure of the annular defect
using a soft tissue suture kit and (2) implantation of
a bone-anchored ACD. Bailey et al60 described a
750-patient RCT to study annular repair using a
soft tissue suture system that was commercially
available at the time of the study. Patients were
randomized 2:1 to annular repair or no annular
repair (control) after discectomy. Included subjects
were candidates for 1- or 2-level lumbar discectomy,
had persistent and predominant leg pain (VAS
leg . 4/10), and were not responsive to 6 weeks of
nonsurgical care. No inclusion or exclusion criteria
specified the size of the annular defect. The authors
reported that annulotomy was performed in 77% of
patients, producing annular defects with a mean size
of 4.75 6 2.0 mm. Assuming a normal distribution,
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73% of annulotomy patients had a defect size less
than 6 mm, which is commonly described as the
threshold for ‘‘large’’ defects.20,59 There were no
significant differences in rates of adverse events or
serious adverse events (SAEs) between the 2 groups.
Clinical outcomes of leg pain, back pain, disability,
and physical function were also similar between the
groups over 2 years of follow up. While there was a
trend of reduced rLDH-related reoperations over 2
years in the annular repair group, the results were
not statistically significant (9.7% versus 11.2%;
P¼ .56). The marginal reductions in reoperation
rate may have been related to the fact that most
patients did not have a large annular defect. In the
subgroup with predominant leg pain, the rate of
rLDH-related reoperations was significantly re-
duced in the annular repair group at 3 months
(1.0% versus 5.9%; P¼ .019) and 6 months (2.0%
versus 6.9%; P ¼ .046) follow up, but not at 2 years
(6.7% versus 12.1%; P ¼ .13).

Several clinical studies, including 2 RCTs and a
prospective comparative cohort study,61–63 have
shown that bone-anchored ACD implantation
reduces the risk of symptomatic rLDH and reoper-
ation compared with discectomy alone (Table 2).
Four additional prospective cohort or registry
studies have also observed positive outcomes and
low revision rates with this treatment technique.64–68

One multicenter RCT analyzed 550 patients with
large (�6 mm wide) annular defects who were
randomized 1:1 to treatment with discectomy alone
(n¼ 278) or discectomy plus a bone-anchored ACD
(n ¼ 272).62,69 The ACD group experienced a
significantly lower rate of symptomatic rLDH
(12% versus 25%; P , .001) and related revision
surgeries (5% versus 13%; P ¼ .001) compared to
discectomy alone over 2 years of follow up.62 At 3
and 4 years follow up, the ACD group also
experienced significantly greater improvement in
pain, disability, and health-related quality of life
scores compared to discectomy alone (P , .05).70,71

Based on Kaplan-Meier survival analysis, the
incidence rates continued to be lower in the ACD
group over a 5 year follow up for symptomatic
index-level rLDH (21.8% versus 32.8%; P , .001)
and index-level reoperation (16.2% versus 22.7%;
P¼ .03).72

According to the FDA’s Summary of Safety and
Effectiveness Data (SSED) related to this device and
RCT, there were 34 (12.7%) device deficiencies
comprised of 5 anchor migrations and 29 events

related to the occlusion component.72 Approximate-

ly half of the deficiencies were asymptomatic, and 12

(4.5%) of those deficiencies were related to a SAE.

Despite these device-related complications, the
ACD group experienced significantly fewer device-

or procedure-related SAEs over a 5-year time period

(P ¼ .037) due to the reduction in symptomatic

rLDH rates.72 The SSED also described the
observation of radiographic endplate lesions (EPLs)

on CT images at a significantly higher rate in the

ACD group (89% versus 41%; P , .001). However,

the size of 90% of the EPLs in both groups
stabilized over the 3- to 5-year observation period.

Further, in the ACD group, no negative clinical

outcomes were associated with the EPLs, based on

patient-reported outcomes, reoperations, or SAEs.

Current evidence suggests that the EPLs do not
impact device function or clinical outcomes at 5

years follow up, and an ongoing study will continue

to monitor safety.72

Cho et al63 reported the results from a separate

60-patient RCT, where 30 patients received discec-
tomy and 30 received discectomy plus a bone-

anchored ACD. By 2 years, the ACD group had a

significantly lower rate of rLDH (3.3% versus 20%;

P¼ .04) compared to discectomy alone. Disc height
was also better maintained at 2 years follow up in

the bone-anchored ACD group compared to control

(86.3% versus 79.2%; P ¼ .04). Both groups expe-

rienced significant improvements in all patient-
reported outcomes related to leg and back pain,

ODI, and quality of life (P , .001). The authors

reported that no complications, including device

migration or loosening, were observed in any

patients within the 2 years of follow up.63

In addition to the 2 RCTs, 4 prospective cohort

studies and 1 retrospective analysis of a real-world

treatment registry were identified (513 patients

total).61,64,66–68 Each of these studies described

positive treatment results with a bone-anchored
ACD, with rLDH rates ranging from 0% to 3.5%

and reoperation rates ranging from 0 to 7.3% over a

1- to 5-year follow-up period. Device-related ad-

verse events occurred at similar rates to the RCT
(2%–8.8%). The current evidence for bone-an-

chored annular closure is derived from 7 unique

studies and 1123 patients (ACD: n¼ 743; control:

n ¼ 380). Collectively, this evidence indicates a

positive benefit-risk ratio for lumbar discectomy
patients with large annular defects, based on
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significant reductions in symptomatic rLDH and
revision surgery in an at-risk population.

Cost Effectiveness

In addition to the clinical benefits, primary
discectomy has been shown to be cost effective
relative to nonsurgical care. A 1996 study found
that discectomy increases quality-adjusted life years
(QALYs) by 0.43 over 10 years at a nondiscounted
cost of $29 200 per QALY.73 More recent (2008 and
2011) studies from Tosteson et al74,75 reported that
the costs for discectomy per QALY ranged from
$34 355 to $69 403 over 2 years follow up and
$20 600 per QALY through 4 years. Furthermore,
data from the National Health Interview Survey
show that patients treated with discectomy return to
work faster, miss fewer workdays, have increased
average earnings, and the increased earnings offset
the cost of surgery.76 When also considering the
effects on employee productivity, surgical discecto-
my may yield a net societal cost savings.76

Compelling evidence has shown that primary
discectomy is a safe and effective treatment for
indicated patients, yet a minority of patients
experience recurring symptoms, and some undergo
revision surgery. Reoperation adds over $44 000 per
patient in direct health care costs over 4 years
following discectomy.77 With approximately 500 000
discectomies per year in the United States,78 it is
important from both economic and socioeconomic
standpoints to identify evidence-based treatment
strategies that help reduce the burden associated
with revision surgeries after discectomy.

Among at-risk patients with large annular de-
fects, we estimate there could be 24 000 reoperations
over any 2-year period in the United States, which
are associated with a substantial economic and
societal impact (Figure 1). Annular repair has
reduced the rLDH-related reoperation rate by over
60% in a 2-year time period,62 which should reduce
the direct health care costs, allow more patients to
return to work and stay at work, and avoid the
significant morbidity associated with reoperation.
Based on RCT data, a bone-anchored ACD was
found to be cost effective at $6030 per QALY over 2
years of follow up, which is well below the standard
willingness-to-pay thresholds.79 When the societal
costs of missed work and lower productivity were
also considered, the incremental cost-effectiveness
ratio of the bone-anchored ACD became negative,
which indicates ‘‘economic dominance’’—improved

outcomes at a lower cost—compared to discectomy
alone.79

COVERAGE RATIONALE

Nonsurgical management is generally the first line
of treatment for patients with LDH and radiculop-
athy. For patients with symptomatic LDH that fail
to improve after 6 weeks of nonsurgical care or have
severe symptoms that necessitate earlier interven-
tion, large bodies of evidence indicate that discec-
tomy is medically necessary and provides superior
outcomes compared to continuing nonsurgical care.
Each discectomy approach (open, microtubular, or
endoscopic) has demonstrated similar clinical ben-
efits and is appropriate for the surgical treatment of
LDH with radiculopathy. The current high-level
clinical evidence supports discectomy (open, micro-
tubular, or endoscopic discectomy) as a medically
necessary procedure for the treatment of LDH with
radiculopathy in indicated patients.

In patients undergoing primary discectomy with a
large (�6 mm wide) annular defect, annular repair
or closure is intended to control the risk of recurring
symptoms and reoperation. Currently, the only
annular repair technique supported by high-level
clinical evidence is bone-anchored annular closure.
A bone-anchored ACD is FDA-approved and
indicated for patients with large annular defects.
Adequate evidence is currently not available to
support suturing of the annulus as an effective
repair technique. The current clinical evidence
supports bone-anchored annular closure for indi-
cated patients to improve the probability of
avoiding rLDH and sustaining the treatment
benefits of discectomy.

INDICATIONS/LIMITATIONS OF
COVERAGE

Patients who have the following clinical indica-
tions may be eligible for discectomy and coverage:

� Clinical signs and symptoms associated with
LDH,

� Imaging confirmation of LDH consistent with
clinical findings,

� Failure to improve after 6 weeks of conserva-
tive care.

Clinical indications for annular closure and
coverage include (based on the FDA-approved
indications):
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� Patient is indicated for a primary discectomy
due to a posterior or posterolateral herniation,

� Discectomy will be performed at a single level
that includes L4–L5 or L5–S1,

� The annular defect is large (between 4 and 6
mm tall and between 6 and 10 mm wide) after
completion of the discectomy procedure.

CODING

Procedural (Current Procedural Terminology
[CPT]) Coding

The American Medical Association recommends
that posterior-posterolateral and/or revision lumbar
discectomy be coded using CPT that are listed
below. For purposes of CPT coding, the primary
approach and visualization define the service.
Unless otherwise specified, lumbar discectomy is
presumed open (which includes microtubular ap-
proach).

Definitions

Direct Visualization
Light-based visualization can (only) be performed
by eye or with surgical loupes, microscope, or
endoscope.

Open
Spinal procedures with continuous direct (light-
based) visualization of the spine through a surgical
opening.

Endoscopic
Spinal procedures performed with continuous direct
(light-based) visualization of the spine through a
surgical opening.

CPT Codes

63030
Laminotomy (hemilaminectomy) with decompres-
sion of nerve root(s), including partial facetectomy,
foraminotomy, and/or excision of herniated inter-
vertebral disc; 1 interspace, lumbar (for bilateral
procedure, report 63030 with modifier 50).

63035
Each additional interspace, lumbar (use 63035 in
conjunction with 63030). (For bilateral procedure,
report 63035 with modifier 50.)

63042
Laminotomy (hemilaminectomy) with decompres-
sion of nerve root(s), including partial facectomy,
foraminotomy, and/or excision of herniated inter-

Figure 1. Estimated impact of rLDH-related reoperation among patients with large annular defects.
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vertebral, reexploration, single interspace, lumbar
(for bilateral procedure, report 63042 with modifier
50).

63044
Each additional lumbar interspace (list separately in
addition to code for primary procedure; use 63044
in conjunction with 63042).

63056
Transpedicular approach with decompression of
spinal cord, equina, and/or nerve root(s) single
segment; lumbar (including transfacet, or lateral
extraforaminal approach; eg, far lateral herniated
intervertebral disc).

63057
Each additional segment, lumbar (list separately in
addition to code for primary procedure; use 63057
in conjunction with 63056).

62380
Endoscopic decompression of spinal cord, nerve
root(s), including laminotomy, partial facectomy,

foraminotomy, discectomy, and/or excision of
herniated intervertebral disc, 1 interspace, lumbar
(for bilateral procedure, report 62380 with modifier
50; effective date: January 2017).

22899

Unlisted procedure, spine. Physicians may report
CPT 22899 for implantation of the bone-anchored
ACD in addition to the appropriate CPT code for
the discectomy procedure (eg, 63030).

Diagnostic (International Classification of
Diseases, Tenth Revision, Clinical Modification

[ICD10-CM]) Coding (diagnosis codes are listed in
Table 3)

Hospital Outpatient-Ambulatory Surgical Center
(ASC) Coding

Medicare created a new Healthcare Common
Procedure Coding System (HCPCS) code that
specifically includes a bone-anchored ACD that
hospital outpatient departments and ASCs should
report for the procedure:

C9757. Laminotomy (hemilaminectomy), with de-
compression of nerve root(s), including partial
facetectomy, foraminotomy and excision of herni-
ated intervertebral disc, and repair of annular defect
with implantation of bone anchored ACD, includ-
ing annular defect measurement, alignment and
sizing assessment, and image guidance; 1 interspace,
lumbar (effective date: January 2020).

DOCUMENTATION REQUIREMENTS

(1) Radiculopathy confirmed on history and
physical examination,

AND

(2) EITHER

� Disabling leg or back pain refractory to 6
weeks of conservative care including any 1 of
the following: time, physician structured
exercise regimen, lumbar epidural therapy,
or physical/chiropractic therapy,

OR

� Progressive neurologic deficit,

AND

(3) Level appropriate documentation of nerve
root compression on imaging (MRI or CT, prefer-

Table 3. Diagnosis codes (International Classification of Diseases, Tenth

Revision, Clinical Modification [ICD10-CM]).

Diagnosis Code Code Descriptor

M51 Thoracic, thoracolumbar, and lumbosacral
intervertebral disc disorders

M51.0 With myelopathy
M51.1 With radiculopathy
M51.2 Other thoracic, thoracolumbar, and lumbosacral

intervertebral disc displacement
M51.3 Other thoracic, thoracolumbar, and lumbosacral

intervertebral disc degeneration
M51.8 Other thoracic, thoracolumbar, and lumbosacral

intervertebral disc disorders
M51.9 Unspecified thoracic, thoracolumbar, and

lumbosacral intervertebral disc disorder
M48.00 Spinal stenosis, site unspecified
M48.05 Spinal stenosis, thoracolumbar region
M48.06 Spinal stenosis, lumbar region
M48.07 Spinal stenosis, lumbosacral region
M48.08 Spinal stenosis, sacral and sacrococcygeal region
M47.1 Other spondylosis with myelopathy
M47.2 Other spondylosis with radiculopathy
M47.16 Other spondylosis with myelopathy, lumbar region
M47.81 Spondylosis without myelopathy or radiculopathy
M47.89 Other spondylosis
M47.9 Spondylosis, unspecified
M43.00 Spondylolysis, site unspecified
M43.05 Spondylolysis, thoracolumbar region
M43.06 Spondylolysis, lumbar region
M43.07 Spondylolysis, lumbosacral region
M43.08 Spondylolysis, sacral and sacrococcygeal region
M43.09 Spondylolysis, multiple sites in spine
M54.5 Low back pain
M54.8 Other dorsalgia
M54.9 Dorsalgia, unspecified
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ably with Myelogram) and/or nerve conduction
velocity/electromyogram.

CONCLUSIONS

Discectomy is a safe and effective procedure for
patients with primary LDH and radiculopathy who
do not respond to nonsurgical care or have severe
and deteriorating symptoms. The current evidence
is consistently in favor of discectomy, rather than
continuing nonsurgical care, for greater and/or
faster alleviation of pain, reduction of disability,
and higher patient satisfaction. Clinical evidence
indicates that microtubular discectomy and endo-
scopic discectomy result in reduced incision size,
soft tissue damage, and hospital stay and yield
similar improvements in symptoms compared to
open discectomy. Currently, evidence-based clini-
cal recommendations for annular repair after
discectomy do not exist. Patients who are indicated
for discectomy and have a large annular defect are
exposed to a greater risk of symptom recurrence
and revision surgery and may benefit from annular
repair. Current level 1 evidence demonstrates that,
in appropriately selected patient populations,
implantation of a bone-anchored ACD reduces
the risk of symptom recurrence and revision
surgery compared to discectomy alone. The current
evidence supports the use of discectomy as well as
consideration for bone-anchored annular repair for
the treatment of indicated patients with primary
symptomatic LDH who may otherwise be at higher
risk for recurrent disc herniation. (This ISASS
Policy addresses only LDH with radiculopathy
that is clinically appropriate for direct visualization
[open, microtubular, or endoscopic discectomy];
the particular primary posterior/posterolateral
surgical procedural approach is the purview of
the surgeon.)
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